
Tagline
It Ships 

Mission
At Ben Air, we’re on a mission to burst free of the transportation industry’s old-fashioned 
limits and restrictions.

Vision
We’re pilots. We see better than 20/20. And our vision is of a world where anything can 
go anywhere.

Ben Air Difference
Forged by former military personnel with a history of getting things done, Ben Air is a 
different kind of transport and logistics company. With the full range of modern 
technology at hand, we believe that anything can go anywhere—and if it can go, 
it should go. 

We’re not a budget option. Let’s get that out of the way right now. Ben Air’s team is 
made of world-class experts, people who are better at what they do than anyone else 
who has ever lived. Our level of expertise doesn’t come cheap, so feel free to shop 
around. If you truly need dangerous goods air transportation, we know you’ll be back. 
Turn to us when literally no other transport company will even touch your shipment.

Want to learn more? Perfect, because that’s what a business website is for. Click here 
to see more about our dangerous goods shipment options, and learn why we’re the only 
choice you have.

Our Pilots
Our pilots are fresh from the world’s finest armed forces. These guys (and a few gals) 
are used to air combat maneuvering in some of the world’s thorniest arenas, so they 
can more than handle our souped-up cargo planes.  

For your safety and theirs, we don’t release the names of our employees. Come on, do 
you really need to know the name of your delivery guy? Rest assured that our pilots 
come to us with decorated military backgrounds. These world-class fliers could have 
gone absolutely anywhere after their discharges. (One of our pilots has a buddy who’s 
now on the space station.) Count yourself lucky that they looked at every option, and 
decided that flying your dangerous goods shipment was their best choice.

Our Team
Dangerous goods logistics involves more than just a flight. How do your goods get from 
your warehouse to wherever it is they’re going? You need door-to-door dangerous 
goods logistics support for your shipment. Let us handle that for you.

Our logistics team features professionals pulled from some of the most ruthlessly 
efficient industries on the modern market. From pharmaceutical sales reps to border 



coyotes, hackers to organized crime drop-outs, big-box executives to some guy who 
won’t shut up about blockchain, we’re like a montage from your favorite heist movie.

With almost equal amounts of board room experience and federal prison time, our full 
logistics team can handle any problem with any dangerous goods shipment. Yes, even 
yours. Just tell Ben Air your problems and watch them all disappear.

What We Ship 
We ship absolutely everything, no matter how dangerous, radioactive, or deadly. 
Assuming your package has a physical form, we will wrangle it onto an airplane and 
take it anywhere on Earth. (Low Earth orbit options are available upon request.)

Is your shipment skirting the legal lines of various jurisdictions? At Ben Air, we don’t 
really care about that. Our well-versed legal team can help you work around tariffs, 
embargoes, immigration offices, regulatory groups, and whatever else might stand in 
your way. Whatever you’re shipping, count on our experience in dangerous goods 
logistics to deliver.

We’re comfortable handling your weird biohazards. If you have anything contagious or 
toxic, our crew simply straps into full biohazard suits. We don’t question why you’re 
shipping whatever you’re shipping, so if you need additional support, just let us know. 
We can provide lab techs, veterinarians, and human-grade medical professionals as 
part of your full-service dangerous goods shipment package.

Don’t worry about any radioactive items. We certainly don’t: that’s why we have lead 
boxes. Our pilots and crew are more than prepared to haul around your radioactive 
items, delivering them to your secret lab, your enemy’s summer home, or wherever 
else.

Does your shipment pose a deadly risk to the people and property around it? We’re 
used to that. We do insist that you disclose the full risks of your item during contract 
negotiations, but we’ve never refused a customer due to any level of perceived 
“danger.” Whatever your item is, we guarantee we’ve seen something worse. 

Click below to start your very own dangerous goods shipment. 

Our Founder 
Ben Yarborough founded Ben Air after a 20-year naval career as a Master Explosive 
Ordnance Disposal Technician. After disposing of his very first explosive device, Ben 
thought, what’s so hard about that? 

After taking care of a few more explosives, Ben eventually discovered that more 
traditional thinkers were very cautious around things that might explode. Combine that 
hesitance with another commonly held fear—fear of flying—and Ben realized there was 
an opportunity vacuum in the dangerous goods air transportation industry. 



Ben Air was born.

Ben’s naval experience forms the model for our transport teams. In addition to working 
with explosive ordinance, Ben trained as a SCUBA and mixed gas diver and a Naval 
Parachutist. This well-rounded tactical background prepared him for any situation. We 
expect our pilots and transport experts to be just as dangerously multitalented, a 
philosophy that has served us well in the field.

Click below to learn more about Ben Air’s dangerous goods shipment options.

Book a Dangerous Goods Shipment
Are you ready to get your dangerous goods out of your hands and into someone else’s? 
Use the form below to begin your intake consultation with Ben Air.

Make sure to read our terms and conditions closely. All our staff operate under strict 
non-disclosure agreements, but we do require you to completely disclose your 
dangerous goods to us as part of our contract process. In the event that your dangerous 
goods shipment poses an undisclosed risk to Ben Air staff, equipment, or property, our 
contract is null and void. Ben Air representatives will assess the situation and take 
immediate steps at our sole discretion. 

When you’re ready, click the form below. At Ben Air, it ships.

IMPORTANT: This written material has been prepared based on sources which you 
provided. Neither Flocksy or the creative who wrote the copy makes any claims 
whatsoever as to the accuracy of the information contained within, and they are not 
responsible for any legal or financial difficulty resulting from the use of this written 
material. We encourage you to review it thoroughly before disseminating it or using it in 
trade.
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